Shirley Rukcic

From: Shirley Rukcic

Sent: Thursday, April 19, 2018 2:43 PM
To: ‘parkingfoi@gmail.com'
Subject: your Sunshine Law request
Attachments: Parkmobile.pdf

Dear Ms. Pembroke- We are in receipt of the Sunshine Law request you originally sent to SLDC pertaining to our
contract with ParkMobile and invoices since 2013. Attached is the contract. if you would like the invoices, we would
need to charge $25.00 to cover the cost of our employee to pull the invoices. Please send payment payable to City of St.

Louis Treasurer’s Office to my address below.
Sincerely,

Shirley Rukcic

Director of Administration & Counsel
City of St. Louis Treasurer’s Office
133 S. 11* St., Ste. 530

St. Louis, MO 63102

314-612-1475

**Please note my new email address of rukcics@stltreasurer.org

CONFIDENTIALITY STATEMENT:

This electronic transmission may contain information that is confidential, privileged, and prohibited
from disclosure and unauthorized use pursuant to applicable law. If you are the intended recipient of
this transmission, be advised that its use is restricted by law and for the purpose stated herein. If you
are not the intended recipient of this transmission, take notice that any viewing, use, dissemination, or
copying of the information transmitted herewith is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
transmission in error, please return it to the sender and delete all copies from your system.



Shirley Rukcic

From: Shirley Rukcic

Sent: Wednesday, May 30, 2018 9:13 AM
To: 'PARKING FOI'

Subject: RE: your Sunshine Law request

Good morning- The check was received yesterday. | will respond shortly with the invoices.

Shirley Rukcic

Director of Administration & Counsel
City of St. Louis Treasurer’s Office
133 S. 11% St., Ste. 530

St. Louis, MO 63102

314-612-1475

**Please note my new email address of rukcics@stitreasurer.org

CONFIDENTIALITY STATEMENT:

This electronic transmission may contain information that is confidential, privileged, and prohibited
from disclosure and unauthorized use pursuant to applicable law. If you are the intended recipient of
this transmission, be advised that its use is restricted by law and for the purpose stated herein. If you
are not the intended recipient of this transmission, take notice that any viewing, use, dissemination, or
copying of the information transmitted herewith is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
transmission in error, please return it to the sender and delete all copies from your system.

From: PARKING FOI! [mailto:parkingfoi@gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, May 25, 2018 11:47 AM

To: Shirley Rukcic <Rukcics@stltreasurer.org>
Subject: Re: your Sunshine Law request

Hello, | hope you are well. | just want to let you know that the check was mailed on 5/18.

Have a great weekend!

On Fri, Apr 20, 2018 at 3:31 PM, Shirley Rukcic <Rukcics@stltreasurer.org> wrote:

Check only.

Shirley Rukcic
Director of Administration & Counsel

City of St. Louis Treasurer’s Office



Shirley Rukcic

From: Shirley Rukcic

Sent: Monday, June 4, 2018 1:15 PM

To: 'PARKING FOI'

Subject: FW: Message from Exec Konica Printer
Attachments: SExec Konic18060413150.pdf

Attached are monthly Parkmobile invoices beginning March 2015 (first contracted month) until March 2018 (38
invoices). Let me know if you would like me to mail them to you.

At this time, we are closing your request as satisfied.
Thank you.

Shirley Rukcic

Custodian of Records

Director of Administration & Counsel
City of St. Louis Treasurer’s Office
133 S. 11 St., Ste. 530

St. Louis, MO 63102

314-612-1475

**Pplease note my new email address of rukcics @stltreasurer.org

CONFIDENTIALITY STATEMENT:
This electronic transmission may contain information that is confidential, privileged, and prohibited

from disclosure and unauthorized use pursuant to applicable iaw. If you are the intended recipient of
this transmission, be advised that its use is restricted by law and for the purpose stated herein. If you
are not the intended recipient of this transmission, take notice that any viewing, use, dissemination, or
copying of the information transmitted herewith is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
transmission in error, please return it to the sender and delete all copies from your system.

From: no_reply

Sent: Monday, June 4, 2018 1:18 PM

To: Shirley Rukcic <Rukcics@stltreasurer.org>
Subject: Message from Exec Konica Printer



