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4‘ NN Rukcic, Shirley <rukcics@stlouis-mo.gov>

A

Fwd: Sunshine Request
8 messages

Boyd, Jared <boydja@stlouis-mo.gov> Tue, May 31, 2016 at 10:05 AM

To: Shirley Rukcic <RukcicS@stlouis-mo.gov>

L. Jared Boyd

Chief of Staff and Counsel

City of St. Louis Treasurer's Office
133 South 11th Street, Suite 530
St. Louis, MO 63102
314.612.1478
BoydJa@stlouis-mo.gov

-—-———- Forwarded message —---——
From: Lauren S Trager <Lauren. Trager@kmov.com>
Date: Tue, May 31, 2016 at 10:03 AM

Subject: Sunshine Request
To: "Boyd, Jared" <boydja@stlouis-mo.gov>, "Abraham, Makita" <abrahamm@stlouis-mo.gov>

Hello,
I hope this email finds you well and that you both had a nice holiday weekend.
Thank you, too, for all your help over the last few weeks.

| am looking for information relative to both Residential and Business parking permits and City-issued Employee Parking
permits.

For the sake of formality, I'll word it as a Sunshine Request. Please see below.

Thank you so much.

Sincerely,

Lauren Trager

Investigative Reporter
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KMOV
314-309-0571

To Whom It May Concern:

Pursuant to state and federal freedom of information legislation, | am requesting the following:

1.) Alist of all Residential and Business parking permits

a. The person or entity to whom or which the permit is issued

b. The date the permit was issued

¢. The amount paid for the permit

d. Renewal dates and amount paid for the renewal, if applicable
2.) A list of all City-issued employee parking permits

a. The person to whom the permit was issued

b. The date the permit was issued

c. The amount paid for the permit

d. Renewal dates and amount paid for the renewal, if applicable

Please let me know if you have any questions or concemn. Thank you so much.

Sincerely,

Lauren Trager
Investigative Reporter
KMOV

314-309-0571

This electronic message, including any attachments, may contain proprietary, confidential or privileged information for
the sole use of the intended recipient(s). You are hereby notified that any unauthorized disclosure, copying, distribution,
or use of this message is prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender by

reply e-mail and delete it.

Lauren S Trager <Lauren.Trager@kmov.com> Tue, Jun 28, 2016 at 4:38 PM

To: "Rukcic, Shirfley” <rukcics@stlouis-mo.gov>

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/2ui=28&ik=9cccecacSa&view=pt&search=inbox&th=1550758b31aa6496&simI|= 1550758b31aa6496&sim|=15598f2babee335d8si... 2/5
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lﬁ!p N Rukcic, Shirley <rukcics@stlouis-mo.gov>

Fwd: Sunshine Request

Rukcic, Shirley <rukcics@stlouis-mo.gov> Wed, Jun 29, 2016 at 11:50 AM
To: Lauren S Trager <Lauren.Trager@kmov.com>
Cc: "Johnson, Debbie" <johnsonde@stlouis-mo.gov>

Lauren- In regards to your Sunshine Law request pertaining to permits:

Request No. 1- We are not in possession of documents in response to your inquiry about Residential parking permits.
We do not issue or manage these permits. | would refer you to the Board of Alderman. In response to your inquiry
about Business permits, | have attached a spreadsheet outlining our current permits,

Request No. 2- | have attached responsive documents that include parking placards issued to the Treasurer's Office
staff, Board of Elections Commissioners, STL Development Corp, and Board of Aldermen. These placards are issued
yearly and without a fee. Additional parking exemptions are granted to city departments by ordinance. For example,
Ordinance 66788, section 109.10 authorizes employees of the Building Division to park at a parking meter without the
payment of fees by displaying a placard. We do not issue or manage any city department placards.

There is no fee associated with this request.

Best regards,
[Quoted text hidden]

Shirley Rukcic

Custodian of Records

Director of Administrative Services & Counsel
City of St. Louis Treasurer's Office

133 South 11th Street, Suite 530

St. Louis, MO 63102

314-612-1475

rukcics@stlouis-mo.gov

2 attachments

@ Business permits- Trager.pdf
754K

4y City Employee placards- Trager.pdf
3094K
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